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Fw: Amira Statement

From: Amira Azazy (amira_azazy@yahoo.com)
To: ahmedelsafty78@yahoo.com
Date: Sunday, June 21, 2020, 06:54 PM GMT+3

Sent from Yahoo Mail for iPhone

On Monday, June 8, 2020, 6:13 PM, Eman Nossir <emy@emysvacations.com> wrote:

Dear Amira,
Below is the full Statement with all refunds and penalties.

Installments Paid CC Fees Net Received Activity Cost Fines from Supplier net after all reimbursement
1st Installment 2,650.00 119.25 2,530.75 3 Bedroom Townhouse with WIFI/Gym/Pool 1,610.00 322
2nd Installment 2,650.00 119.25 2,530.75 Airline Tickets United/Laufthanza 5,500.00 1029.05
3rd Installment 2,650.00 119.25 2,530.75 Car Rental Medim SUV 1,120.00 224
4th Installment 2,650.00 119.25 2,530.75 Disney Parks (4)+ 3 Fast Pass each Park 2,447.00 489.1
- Universal Parks ( 3) 1,400.00 0
- SeaWorld Parks 2 Parks 500.00 0
- Seat Reservation 512.00 0
Emy's Fees 500
Total 10,600.00 477.00 10,123.00 13,089.00 2564.15 7,558.85
Thanks,

Eman Nossir

President and Co-Owner
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Emy’s Vacations LLC
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Email: emy@emysvacations.com
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