toms@infoeng.net

From: toms@infoeng.net

Sent: Wednesday, July 29, 2020 5:32 PM
To: ‘support@ragingbull.com'
Subject: RE: 2'nd $20k Pick: Trade Plan
Hello?

From: toms@infoeng.net <toms@infoeng.net>

Sent: Thursday, July 23, 2020 11:56 AM

To: 'support@ragingbull.com' <support@ragingbull.com>
Subject: RE: 2'nd $20k Pick: Trade Plan

Where does my refund stand, because | never got the Wed trade info, nor did | get the “extra trade due to technical
issues” | was supposed to get on Thursday?

From: Tom Steele <toms@infoeng.net>

Sent: Tuesday, July 14, 2020 11:19 AM

To: 'support@ragingbull.com' <support@ragingbull.com>
Subject: RE: 2'nd $20k Pick: Trade Plan

Again this came out so late that QQQ was already at $256, which is above the targeted $255 Call price.

How do | get my $199 back, because this is already 3 trades I’'ve missed out on as a result of delays and “technical
glitches”?

Thanks...Tom
561.404.3648

From: Jeff's 20k Trades <support@ragingbull.com>
Sent: Tuesday, July 14, 2020 10:21 AM

To: toms@infoeng.net

Subject: 2'nd $20k Pick: Trade Plan




